

BANK OF BARODA																	
DETAILS OF CONTRACTS CONCLUDED DURING THE MONTH OF MAY 2016																	
Sr. No.	Month	zone	Region	Tender no.	Item/ Nature of work	Mode of tender inquiry	Date of Publication of NIT	Type of Bidding (single two bid system)	Last date of receipt of tender	Nos of tenders recorded	Nos and names of parties qualified after technical evaluation	Nos and names of parties not qualified after technical evaluation	Whether contract awarded to lowest tenderer / L1	Contract no & date	Name of Contractor	Value of Contract in Rs.	Scheduled date of completion
	A	B	C	1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8	9	10	11	12	13	14
1	May-16	BCC	MKTG	1	Empanelment of Market Research Agency	Open tender	16.2.2016	Two bid system	14.3.2016	4	1. IMRB International 2. Nielsen (I) Pvt. Ltd. 3. Ipsos	TNS India Pvt. Ltd	Yes	1. BCC:MKTG-MR:10 8:1999 dt. 17.5.16 2. BCC:MKTG-MR:10 8:2000 dt. 17.5.2016 3. BCC:MKTG-MR:10 8:2001 dt. 17.5.2016	IMRB International 2. Nielsen (I) Pvt. Ltd. 3. Ipsos	12,538,110.00	Empanelment for a period of 3 years
2	May-16	BCC	MKTG	2	Selection of one Market Research Agency for carrying immediate study on customer satisfaction & brand health	Open tender	16.2.2016	Two bid system	14.3.2016	4	1. IMRB International	1. Nielsen (I) Pvt. Ltd. 2. Ipsos 3. TNS India Pvt. Ltd.	Yes	1. BCC:MKTG-MR:10 8:1951 dt. 6.5.2016 2. BCC:MKTG-MR:10 8:1952 dt. 6.5.2016	IMRB International	51,94,696.00	1.10.2016
3	May-16	BCC	IT	1	Selection of Managed Services Provider for Management, Operations, Support, and Maintenance of DC, DRC, NDR Infrastructure along with Core Banking & Other Applications	a) RFQ - BCC:IT:PROC:107: 28 dated 02-09-2015 published on Website and Newspaper b) RFP Tender Date - 05-01-2016 c) RFP re floated Tender Date - 31-03-2016	a) RFQ Tender Date - 02-09-2015 b) RFP Tender Date - 05-01-2016 c) RFP re floated Commercial Date - 11-04-2016	Two	a) RFP Commercial Date - 28-03-2016 b) RFP re floated Commercial Date - 11-04-2016	a) RFQ - Two tenders b) RFP - One Tender c) RFP Re floated - One Tender	a) RFQ - Hewlett Packard Enterprise India Pvt Ltd and Wipro Ltd. b) RFP - Hewlett Packard Enterprise India Pvt Ltd	NIL	Yes	BCC:IT:ITP:PROC:108: 693 18th June 2016	Hewlett Packard Enterprise India Pvt Ltd	539,23,14,385/- for a contract period of 7 years	7 Years
4	May-16	BCC	IT	2	Renewal of Subscription to AML Accuity Watch - List for India and 22 International territories	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	REV235 Dated 12.05.2016	Accuity INC	7,170,467.00	1.3.2016
5	May-16	BCC	IT	3	Implementation of Cash @ POS for Visa Interchange	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	CR 1372 Dated 10-05-2016	Hewlett Packard Enterprise India Pvt Ltd	578,000.00	30.9.2016
6	May-16	BCC	IT	4	Customization in Supervisor Module for template Maintenance and Mapping, Modification of Client application	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	CR 1355B Dated 10-05-2016	Hewlett Packard Enterprise India Pvt Ltd	372,000.00	2.6.2016

Sr. No.	Month	zone	Region	Tender no.	Item/Nature of work	Mode of tender inquiry	Date of Publication of NIT	Type of Bidding (single two bid system)	Last date of receipt of tender	Nos of tenders recorded	Nos and names of parties qualified (for technical evaluation)	Nos and names of parties not qualified after technical evaluation	Whether contract awarded to lowest bidder / L1	Contract no & date	Name of Contractor	Value of Contract in Rs.	Scheduled date of completion
7	May-16	BCC	IT	5	Renewal of 3 no. of 64 Kbps MPLS links for ATM at kokilaben Hospital, Mumbai	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	BCC:IT:JTP-PROC:108:539 11th May, 2016	Reliance Communications Ltd	382,500.00	11.6.2016
8	May-16	BCC	IT	6	SA for Microsoft Products (Trueup Year 1)	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	BCC:IT:PMO:108:613 Dated 31-05-2016	Wipro Ltd	45,088,675.00	1-/6/2-16
9	May-16	BCC	IT	7	Renewal of Annual Technical Support with Oracle for the period upto 31-05-2017 for non-ULA products	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	NA	BCC:IT:PMO:108:593 Dated 26-05-2016 (HPE) & BCC:IT:PMO:108:592 Dated 27-05-2016	Hewlett Packard Enterprise India Pvt Ltd & Sonata Information Technology Ltd	14,660,346.00	2-/6/16
10	May-16	M&G	Aurangabad	1	Electrical work of Viregaon Branch	Website	15.01.2016	Two bid system	04.02.2016	2	1. SHRIKRISHNA ELECTRICAL & ENG. 2. VEDANT ELECTRICALS	NO	Yes	RO/AUR/P&E/2016 DATE:02.05.2016	M/S VEDANT ELECTRICALS	3,08,000.00	02.06.2016
11	May-16	MPC	Raipur	1	Interior furnishing of newly proposed Branch at Gurur, Dist.Balod(C.G.)	Website	23.03.2016	Two bid system	12.04.2016	8	M/s Bisen Electricals, M/s Nayak Associates, M/s Diebold Pvt Ltd., M/s Usha Interior, Bhopal, M/s Sanjay Wood Product, M/s Aakriti Interiors, Bhopal, M/s Celsius Engineering Solutions Pvt Ltd,	nil	Yes	RO:RPR:28:P&E:463 dated 05.01.2016	M/s Bisen Electricals	622,654.00	14.06.2016
12	May-16	SGZ	Bulsar	1	Civil Construction (BSVS Bulsar)	website	3.5.2015	Two bid system	25.5.2015	3	1. Parihar Construction Co. 2. Creative Interiors 3. Umesh Engg. Works	Nil	Yes	RO:BUL:PE/36/13 dated 2.5.16	Umesh Engg.Works	8,131,999.00	31.12.2016
13	May-16	SGZ	Bulsar	2	Electric worl (BSVS Bulsar)	website	3.5.2015	Two bid system	25.5.2015	3	1. Parihar Construction Co. 2. Creative Interiors 3. Umesh Engg. Works	Nil	Yes	RO:BUL:PE:36/14 dt. 2.5.2016	Umesh Engg.Works	701,304.00	31.12.2016
14	May-16	SGZ	Bulsar	3	Electrical work of Chanod Branch	sealed quotations from empanelled vendors / contractors	NA	NA	NA	3	1. Utkarsh Electricals 2. Kruti Electricals 3. Vaibhava Electricals	Nil	Yes	RO:BUL:PE:36/34 dt. 29.5.16	Utkarsh Electricals	351,760.00	30.6.2016

Sr. No.	Month	zone	Region	Tender no.	Item/Nature of work	Mode of tender inquiry	Date of Publication of NIT	Type of Bidding (single/two bid system)	Last date of receipt of tender	Nos of tenders recorded	Nos and names of parties qualified (after technical evaluation)	Nos and names of parties not qualified after technical evaluation	Whether contract awarded to lowest bidder/ L1	Contract no & date	Name of Contractor	Value of Contract in Rs.	Scheduled date of completion
15	May-16	EZ	NES	1	Furnishing & Electrical works at new premise of C. R. Avenue(s) branch	Website	27.04.2016	Two bid system	18.05.2016	7	1) M/s Prescience techno industries 2) M/s Supermach. 3) M/s Carlie and lawrie . 4) M/s S A enterprise 5) M/s Pacific enterprise	1.M/s Sargam engineering 2.M/s Bhandari enterprise	YES	DGM: KMR:OPS & SER/16/57 dt 30.05.2016	M/s Supermach	28,36,761/-	01.07.2016
16	May-16	EZ	KMR	1	Furbishment & Electrical works at Barpeta Branch, Barpeta Town	Website	27.04.2016	Two bid system	17.05.2016	8	1) M/s Megabyte 2) M/s Anjali Decor 3) Biren Ch Das 4) P.K Baruah 5) M/s Anu Power Service 6) M/s Park Interior 7) M/s P&K Construction 8) M/s Digi Solutions & Services	NIL	YES	RM:NES:P&E:2016-17/1 dt 24.05.2016	M/s Megabyte	6,95,285.00	18.06.2016
17	May-16	NGZ	ACR	1	Electric work of Virangam Branch	website	23.4.2016	Two bid system	13.5.2016	4	1. Power Control 2. Parameter Engg. 3. Urmi Electric Co. 4. Indian Electric Corp.	Nil	Yes	BOB/ACR/P&E/2016/427 dt. 25.5.16	Urmi Electric Co.	338,675.00	20 days
18	May-16	NGZ	Anand	1	Electrical work, Uttarsanda Branch	website	30.03.2016	Two bid system	19.04.2016	5	1. Parametr Engineering Projects, 2. Dave Electricals, 3. Shreeji Projects, 4. Umesh Engineering Works 5. Creative Interiors	Creative Interiors	YES	NGZ/AR/P&E/30/219 16.05.2016	M.s Dave Electricals, Anand	2,12,565.00	26.06.2016
19	May-16	NGZ	Anand	2	AC work, Uttarsanda Branch	website	30.03.2016	Two bid system	19.04.2016	5	1. Suraj Sales Corporation, 2. Shaina Cooling System, 3. Param Enterprise, 4. Empire Air Conditioning 5. Oum Marketing	Oum Marketing	YES	NGZ/AR/P&E/30/221 16.05.2016	M/s. Shaina Cooling Systems, Surat	□ 2,65,020/-	26.06.2016
20	May-16	NGZ	Rajkot	1	AC Work of Shastrinagar Branch	website	17.12.2015	Two bid system	07.01.2016	3	1. Param Enterprises 2. Unique Services 3. Harshar Furniture Mart	NIL	YES	NGZ/RR/P&E/30/WO/AC/SHASTR /30 DTD. 22/01/2016	M/s Param Enterprises	□ 3,16,896/-	28.03.2016
21	May-16	RZ	Bikaner	1	Refurbishment work of Bhadasar Branch Distt. Churu	website	08.04.2016	Two bid system	29.04.2016	6	1. M/s Mamta Wood Decoraters (India) 2. M/s Ecliptic Enterprises Jaipur 3. beeky arts 4. Divyakash Consultant 5. Furniture Selection House	1. Beekay Arts Mumbai 2. Ecliptic enterprises 3. Vishnu Furniture	Yes	RO/BIKA/P&E/03/2016/ 201 DT. 23.05.2016	M/s Mamta Wood Decoraters (India)	5,12,575/-	20.06.2016

Sr. No.	Month	zone	Region	Tender no.	Item/ Nature of work	Mode of tender inquiry	Date of Publication of NIT	Type of Bidding (single two bid system)	Last date of receipt of tender	Nos of tenders recorded	Nos and names of parties qualified (for technical evaluation)	Nos and names of parties not qualified after technical evaluation	Whether contract awarded to lowest bidder/ L1	Contract no & date	Name of Contractor	Value of Contract in Rs.	Scheduled date of completion
22	May-16	RZ	Bikaner	2	Furnishing work of Padampur Branch Distt. Sriganganagar	website	23.04.2016	Two bid system	16.05.2016	4	1.Rohit Furniture Udyog 2.Mamta Wood Decorate 3.Furniture Selection House	1.Beekay Arts Mumbai	Yes	RO/BIKA/P&E/03 /2016/ 202 DT. 25.05.2016	M/s Furniture Selection House	6,56,000/-	20.06.2016
23	May-16	RZ	Bikaner	3	Furnishing work of Gousainsar Branch Distt. Jhunjhunu	website	08.04.2016	Two bid system	29.04.2016	6	1. M/s Mamta Wood Decoraters (India) 2. M/s Ecliptic Enterprises Jaipur 3.beeky arts 4.Divyakash Consultant 5.Furniture Selection House	1.Beekay Arts Mumbai 2.Ecliptic enterprises 3.Vishnu Furniture	Yes	RO/BIKA/P&E/03 /2016/ 200 DT. 23.05.2016	M/s Divyakash Consultant	7,49,348/-	15.06.2016
24	May-16	RZ	Bikaner	4	Furnishing work of Poogal Branch Distt. Jhunjhunu	website	04.04.2016	Two bid system	26.04.2016	7	1. M/s Mamta Wood Decoraters (India) 2. M/s Ecliptic Enterprises Jaipur 3.beeky arts 4. Shree Shyam Universal 5.Divyakash Consultant 6.Furniture Selection House 7. Vishnu Furniture	1.Beekay Arts Mumbai 2.Ecliptic enterprises 3.Vishnu Furniture	Yes	RO/BIKA/P&E/03 /2016/ 199 DT. 23.05.2016	M/s Divyakash Consultant	5,98,924/-	15.06.2016
25	May-16	RZ	Bikaner	5	Furnishing work of Gharsana Branch Distt. Jhunjhunu	website	04.04.2016	Two bid system	26.04.2016	7	1. M/s Mamta Wood Decoraters (India) 2. M/s Ecliptic Enterprises Jaipur 3.beeky arts 4. Shree Shyam Universal 5.Divyakash Consultant 6.Furniture Selection House	1.Beekay Arts Mumbai 2.Ecliptic enterprises 3.Vishnu Furniture	Yes	RO/BIKA/P&E/03 /2016/ 198 DT. 23.05.2016	M/s Furniture Selection House	6,36,000/-	20.06.2016
26	May-16	RZ	Jaipur	1	Interior Furnishing, Electrical, Data Cabling, Air Conditioner work at Homeopathy University Branch, Jaipur	website	07.04.2016	Two bid system	28.04.2016	5	i) Shree Shyam Universal ii)Rohit Furniture Udyog iii)Furniture Selection House iv)RG & Associates v)Arpita jain & Associates	Nil	Yes	जस/परि/एव/उप/2016/90 दिनांक 04.05.2016	Furniture Selection House	11,60,000/-	03.06.2016
27	May-16	RZ	Kota	1	Furnishing work of Badakuwa Branch Tonk	website	12.04.2016	Two bid system	02.05.2016	5	1. M/s. Furniture Selection House 2. M/s. Arpita Jain & Associates 3. M/s. Rohit Furniture Udyog -	Nil	Yes	ROKOTA:P&E: 2016:5058 dated 23.05.2016	M/s. Furniture Selection House	6,96,000/-	22.06.2016
28	May-16	RZ	Udaipur	1	Tender for furnishing , installation of A.C., Data cabling etc at E-Lobby Bapu Bazar Udaipur	website	12.04.2016	Two bid system	02.05.2016	4	1. Furniture selection house 2. Rohit Furniture Udyog 3. Shree Ram Furniture Mart 4. Prakash electricals	Nil	Yes	UR/P&E/2016/34 DT. 20.05.2016	Prakash electricias	7,69,191/-	20.06.2016

Sr. No.	Month	zone	Region	Tender no.	Item/Nature of work	Mode of tender inquiry	Date of Publication of NIT	Type of Bidding (single two bid system)	Last date of receipt of tender	Nos of tenders recorded	Nos and names of parties qualified after technical evaluation	Nos and names of parties not qualified after technical evaluation	Whether contract awarded to lowest bidder / L1	Contract no & date	Name of Contractor	Value of Contract in Rs.	Scheduled date of completion
29	May-16	NZ	Zone	1	Interior, electrical and allied work for renovation of entrance lobby at Ground floor bldg. of BOB, PS New Delhi	website	25.2.2016	Two bid system	30.3.2016	4	1. P D Singh & Bros 2. Digital Consultants 3. Goel Construction & Engineers 4. Modern Decorators	Nil	Yes	ZO:NZ:EM:2016:35 35 dt. 10.5.2016	Modern Decorators	1,093,033.00	30 days
30	May-16	KAPT	Zone	1	Interior furnishing of Koppal Branch	website	31.3.2016	Two Bid	21.4.2016	4	1. Oriental Furnishing 2.Amrut Pawar Infrastructure 3. Naveen Enterprises	Shanta Electrical & Engineers	Yes	HUB:P&E:01/KOP/23 DT 05/05/2016 WORK ORDER ISSUED ON 20/05/2016	Oriental Furnishing	9,44,475.00	10.6.2016
31	May-16	EUP	Faizabad	1	AAA class currency chest door	website	29.3.2016	Single bid system	13.04.2016	3	1. Devlok Distributors 2. Godrej Boyce Mfg. Co. Ltd	1. Fabreq System Pvt. Ltd. (Safeage)	Yes	UPU/05/P&E/62 dt. 18.5.2016	Develok Distributors	2,759,275.00	30.6.2016
32	May-16	GMZ	Zone	1	installation of wooden flooring on Credit Deptt Side of	Quotations	-	Single	-	3	1.Vogue Marketing 2. Style n Design 3. Jinal Enterprises	-	L-1	ZOGM:AGM:P&E:41:2016, dated 04.05.2016	Vogue Marketing	2,78,566/-	10.05.2016
33	May-16	GMZ	Zone	2	installation of wooden flooring in Board Room, 4th Floor of Greater Mumbai Zone	Quotations	-	Single	-	3	1.Vogue Marketing 2. Kwik Interiors 3. Jinal Enterprises	-	L-1	ZOGM:AGM:P&E:41:2016, dated 13.05.2016	Kwik Interiors	4,30,150/-	13.05.2016
34	May-16	GMZ	Zone	3	installation of wooden flooring in Dining Area, 4th Floor of Greater Mumbai Zone	Quotations	-	Single	-	3	1.Vogue Marketing 2. Kwik Interiors 3. Jinal Enterprises	-	L-1	ZOGM:AGM:P&E:41:2016, dated 16.05.2016	Kwik Interiors	3,17,410/-	20.05.2016
35	May-16	GMZ	MMSR	1	Civil Work (SVP Road,Prarthana Samaj-E Lobby)	Website	17.03.2016	Two bid	06.04.2016	7	1.M/s Taran Const. Co 2.M/s General Contracting Services 3. M/s Shree Jhakar Enterprises. 4.M/s Kumar Const. & Interior 5.M/s Aakash Enterprise 6.M/s J. Singh Interior Decorators 7.M/s Mrudang Shah	02/05/02 General Contracting Services	Yes	01/07 13.04.2016	Ms. Taran Const. Co	549000/-	20.05.2016

Sr. No.	Month	zone	Region	Tender no.	Item/Nature of work	Mode of tender inquiry	Date of Publication of NIT	Type of Bidding (single two bid system)	Last date of receipt of tender	Nos of tenders recorded	Nos and names of parties qualified technical evaluation	Nos and names of parties not qualified after technical evaluation	Whether contract awarded to lowest bidder / L1	Contract no & date	Name of Contractor	Value of Contract in Rs.	Scheduled date of completion
36	May-16	GMZ	MMSR	2	Air Conditioning Work - (C.P Tank Branch)	Limited Tender	18.03.2016	Single Bid	30.03.2016	3	1.Royalchips Appliances Co. 2.AQSA Airconditioning & Refrigeration Co 3.Pioneer Air Conditioning Solution	Nil	Yes	01/03 10.05.2016	M/s Royalchips Appliances Co.	287550/-	15.05.2016
37	May-16	GMZ	MMSR	3	Air Conditioning Work - (Mangaldas Market Branch)	Limited Tender	19.05.2016	Single Bid	30.03.2016	3	1.Sterling Air-Conditioning enterprises 2.AQSA Airconditioning & Refrigeration Co 3.Pioneer Air Conditioning Solution	Nil	Yes	01/03 date24/05/2016	M/s Sterling Air-Conditioning enterprises	215452/-	30.05.2016
38	May-16	GMZ	MMSR	4	Condenser coil replacement work in AC - (CBO Branch)	Limited Tender	16.03.2016	Single Bid	28.04.2016	3	1.Cooling Solutions 2. Star Aircon Engineering Pvt Ltd. 3.Snowmex Refrigeration	Nil	Yes	03/03 date 20/05/2016	M/s Snowmex Refrigeration	158700/-	30.05.2016
39	May-16	GMZ	MMSR	5	Air Conditioning Work - (M J Market Branch)	Limited Tender	10.03.2016	Single Bid	06.04.2016	3	1.Sterling Air-Conditioning enterprises 2.AQSA Airconditioning & Refrigeration Co 3.Pioneer Air Conditioning Solution	Nil	Yes	01/03 date 06/04/2016	M/s Sterling Air-Conditioning enterprises	410000/-	01.05.2016
40	May-16	GMZ	MMSR	6	Air Conditioning Work - (Backbay Reclamation Branch)	Limited Tender	13.04.2016	Single Bid	20.04.2016	3	1.M/s Sterling Air-Conditioning enterprises 2.AQSA Airconditioning & Refrigeration Co 3.Pioneer Air Conditioning Solution	Nil	Yes	01/03 date 04/05/2016	M/s Sterling Air-Conditioning enterprises	202620/-	15.05.2016
41	May-16	BCC	HRM	1	Invitation Document for empanelment of Human Resource Recruitment Consultant for hiring manpower in Senior Management positions in Bank of Baroda	NEWSPAPER ADVERTISEMENT & BANK'S WEBSITE	2.2.2016	Two bid system	10.2.2016	7	1. Accord Group (I) Pvt. Ltd. 2. Futurestep (A Kornferry Co.) 3. Egon Zehnder 4. Heidrick & Struggles	1. Orion Security Solutions Pvt Ltd. 2. Team Lease 3. T & M Services Consulting Pvt. Ltd.	So far communication by email dated 18.2.2016 has been sent to all the technically qualified applicants regarding their empanelment.		Same as coloum No. 8	-NA-	Empanelment is for a period of 3 years
42	May-16	BCC	HRM	2	Facilitate the Bank to hire Head-Retail credit	Email dtd 01.05.2016 wherein Terms of Reference was sent	1.5.16	Two Bid system	04.05.2016	3	1. Accord Group (I) Pvt. Ltd. 2. Kornferry Co. 3. Heidrick & Struggles	Egon Zehnder(No bid was submitted)	Techno Commercial evaluation was undertaken. H1 is the	Letter No. BCC:HRM:HR-A:108/3915-A dated 12.5.2016	KORNFERRY	25 LACS	

Sr. No.	Month	zone	Region	Tender no.	Item/Nature of work	Mode of tender inquiry	Date of Publication of NIT	Type of Bidding (single two bid system)	Last date of receipt of tender	Nos of tenders recorded	Nos and names of parties qualified after technical evaluation	Nos and names of parties not qualified after technical evaluation	Whether contract awarded to lowest bidder/ L1	Contract no & date	Name of Contractor	Value of Contract in Rs.	Scheduled date of completion
43	May-16	BCC	HRM	3	Facilitate the Bank to hire Head- MSME Credit	Email dtd 01.05.2016 wherein Terms of Reference was sent	1.5.16	Two Bid system	04.05.2016	3	1. Accord Group (I) Pvt. Ltd. 2. Kornferry Co. 3. Heidrick & Struggles	Egon Zehnder(No bid was submitted)	Techno Commercial evaluation was undertaken. H1 is the successful bidder	Letter No. BCC:HRM:HR-A:108/3915-A dated 12.5.2016	KORNFERRY	25 LACS	
44	May-16	BCC	HRM	4	Facilitate the Bank to hire Head- Digital Ventures	Email dtd 01.05.2016 wherein Terms of Reference was sent	1.5.16	Two bid system	04.05.2016	3	1. Accord Group (I) Pvt. Ltd. 2. Kornferry Co. 3. Heidrick & Struggles	Egon Zehnder(No bid was submitted)	Techno Commercial evaluation was undertaken. H1 is the successful bidder	Letter No. BCC:HRM:HR-A:108/3915-B dated 12.5.2016	Heidrick & Struggles	31.5 lacs	
45	May-16	BCC	HRM	5	Facilitate the Bank to hire Chief Risk Officer-	Email dtd 01.05.2016 wherein Terms of Reference was sent	1.5.16	Two Bid system	04.05.2016	3	1. Accord Group (I) Pvt. Ltd. 2. Kornferry Co. 3. Heidrick & Struggles	Egon Zehnder(No bid was submitted)	Techno Commercial evaluation was undertaken. H1 is the successful bidder	Letter No. BCC:HRM:HR-A:108/3915-B dated 12.5.2016	Heidrick & Struggles	31.5 LACS	
46	May-16	BCC	HRM	6	Facilitate the Bank to hire Chief Financial Officer	Email dtd 01.05.2016 wherein Terms of Reference was sent	1.5.16	Two bid system	04.05.2016	4	1. Accord Group (I) Pvt. Ltd. 2. Kornferry Co. 3. Egon Zehnder 4. Heidrick & Struggles	NA	Techno Commercial evaluation was undertaken. H1 is the successful bidder	Letter No. BCC:HRM:HR-A:108/3915-B dated 12.5.2016	Heidrick & Struggles	31.5 LACS	
47	May-16	BCC	HRM	7	Facilitate the Bank to hire MD & CEO-BOBCAPS-	Email dtd 01.05.2016 wherein Terms of Reference was sent	1.5.16	Two bid system	04.05.2016	4	1. Accord Group (I) Pvt. Ltd. 2. Kornferry Co. 3. Egon Zehnder 4. Heidrick & Struggles	NA	Techno Commercial evaluation was undertaken. H1 is the successful bidder	Letter No. BCC:HRM:HR-A:108/3915-B dated 12.5.2016	Heidrick & Struggles	31.5 LACS	
48	May-16	BCC	HRM	8	Facilitate the Bank to hire Head - Shared Services	Email dated 11.05.2016 wherein Terms of Reference was sent	11.5.16	Two bid system	16.05.2016	3	1. Accord Group (I) Pvt. Ltd. 2. Kornferry Co. 3. Heidrick & Struggles	Egon Zehnder(No bid was submitted)	Techno Commercial evaluation was undertaken. H1 is the successful bidder	Letter No. BCC:HRM:HR-A:108/4604-A dated 19.5.2016	Heidrick & Struggles	31.5 LACS	